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  Draft report 
 
 

  Chapter II 
 
 

  Recommendations and decisions 
 
 

 E. Spin-off benefits of space technology: review of current status 
 
 

1. The Committee considered the agenda item entitled “Spin-off benefits of space 
technology: review of current status”, in accordance with General Assembly 
resolution 69/85. 

2. The representatives of Brazil, Canada, Colombia, India, Japan, the Republic of 
Korea and the United States made statements under the item. 

3. The Committee heard the following technical presentations under the item: 

 (a) “Space life science: the fallout on Earth”, by the representative of Italy; 

 (b) “Examples of Canadian spin-offs and spin-ins from space technologies”, 
by the representative of Canada. 

4. The Committee took note of the information provided by States on their 
national practices regarding spin-offs from space technology that had resulted in the 
introduction of strategies for the management of regional economic development. It 
also took note of innovations in numerous scientific areas, such as medicine, 
biology, chemistry and materials sciences. It further took note of practical 
applications in civil society, such as the use of enhanced robotics in medicine and of 
colour photometry to monitor water levels for the benefit of agriculture, and the use 
of enhanced technologies to reduce energy consumption, improve techniques in 
lubrication, cutting and drilling, and to facilitate resource exploration, infrastructure 
improvements, firefighting, geographical positioning, navigation and the tracking of 
search and rescue personnel. 
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5. The Committee agreed that spin-offs from space technology constituted a 
powerful engine for technological innovation and growth in both the industrial and 
the service sectors. It also agreed that spin-offs could be applied to achieve social 
and economic objectives and sustainable development goals. 

6. The Committee noted that Governments had developed national policies 
directed specifically at disseminating space technologies and actively promoting 
spin-offs by streamlining licensing and procedures to protect intellectual property to 
facilitate and support the market entry of products derived from space technology 
by start-up companies. 

7. The Committee agreed that the use of spin-offs from space technology should 
be further promoted because it had fostered the development of innovative 
technologies in other sectors, thus advancing national economies and contributing to 
a better quality of life. 

8. The Committee noted that Governments had successfully involved the private 
sector and academia in various projects in which spin-offs from space technology 
were put to use. 

9. The NASA publication “Spinoff 2015” was made available to the Committee. 
 
 

 I. Future role of the Committee 
 
 

10. The Committee considered the agenda item entitled “Future role of the 
Committee”, in accordance with General Assembly resolution 69/85. 

11. The representatives of Canada, Chile, China, the Czech Republic, Italy, Japan, 
Mexico, Poland, the Russian Federation, Switzerland, the United Kingdom, the 
United States, Venezuela (Bolivarian Republic of) and Viet Nam made statements 
under the item. During the general exchange of views, statements relating to the 
item were also made by representatives of other member States. 
 

 1. Joint ad hoc meeting of the First and Fourth Committees of the General 
Assembly 
 

12. The Committee welcomed the joint ad hoc meeting of the First and Fourth 
Committees of the General Assembly, to be convened by the Assembly in 
accordance with its resolution 69/38. The meeting was to address possible 
challenges to space security and the long-term sustainability of space activities. 

13. The Committee noted that the joint ad hoc meeting would be held on  
22 October 2015 in the afternoon, and that it would be chaired by the Presidents of 
the First and Fourth Committees. The Presidents would issue a summary of the 
debate in accordance with the rules of procedure of the General Assembly. 

14. The Committee noted that a decision on the format of the joint ad hoc meeting 
would be made by the Bureaux of the First and Fourth Committees. It requested the 
Secretariat to communicate to the Bureaux the recommendations made by the 
Committee and subsequently inform States members of the Committee about the 
decision made. 
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15. The Committee recommended that the joint ad hoc meeting should comprise a 
panel discussion followed by general debate. The panel should comprise the Chair 
of the Group of Governmental Experts on Transparency and Confidence-building 
Measures in Outer Space Activities, the High Representative for Disarmament 
Affairs and the Director of the Office for Outer Space Affairs. 

16. The Committee recommended that the following subtopics should be 
addressed in the joint ad hoc meeting: space debris, space weather, the long-term 
sustainability of outer space activities, and transparency and confidence-building 
measures in outer space activities. 

17. The Committee noted that the note by the Secretariat entitled 
“Recommendations of the Group of Governmental Experts on Transparency and 
Confidence-building Measures in Outer Space Activities: views of States members 
of the Committee on the Peaceful Uses of Outer Space” (A/AC.105/1080 and Add.1 
and 2) would be made available to the joint ad hoc meeting. 

18. The view was expressed that, in line with General Assembly resolution 68/50, 
on transparency and confidence-building measures in outer space activities, the 
Committee could provide the joint ad hoc meeting with a report on the practical 
measures undertaken by States members of the Committee relating to the 
recommendations of the Group of Governmental Experts. The report could 
summarize responses to the questionnaire distributed to member States regarding 
such practical measures and would be circulated in advance among the member 
States that had contributed to the report, so that it could be updated and then 
submitted to the joint ad hoc meeting. 

19. The view was expressed that the joint ad hoc meeting could discuss, among 
other things, the implementation of transparency and confidence-building measures 
proposed in the report of the Group of Governmental Experts, the development of a 
universally accepted international code of conduct and the interpretation of the right 
to self-defence in outer space. 
 

 2. UN-Space and the report of the Group of Governmental Experts on 
Transparency and Confidence-building Measures in Outer Space Activities 
 

20. The Committee requested the Secretariat to issue a special report by UN-Space 
for consideration by the Committee at its fifty-ninth session on the implementation 
of the report of the Group of Governmental Experts as pertaining to the United 
Nations system, and to coordinate the preparation of that report with relevant United 
Nations entities. The report should note how United Nations entities supported the 
implementation of transparency and confidence-building measures in outer space 
activities in accordance with their existing mandates, and identify how United 
Nations entities could assist Member States in implementing the recommendations 
of the Group. The report should also address means to coordinate the work of 
United Nations entities in line with the overall recommendations of the report of the 
Group as endorsed by the General Assembly in its resolution 68/50. 
 

 3. Future role of the Committee 
 

21. The Committee agreed that the Scientific and Technical Subcommittee should 
establish an expert group on the topic of space objects and events. The expert group 
should meet on the margins of the fifty-third session of the Subcommittee to draft 
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its terms of reference and present them to the Subcommittee, and should designate a 
rapporteur. The Committee agreed that no Secretariat services would be required for 
the expert group, but that the Office should be substantively involved in its work. In 
order to advance its work, the points of contact for the Working Group on the Long-
term Sustainability of Outer Space Activities could be contacted for further 
consultations in the intersessional period leading up to the fifty-third session of the 
Subcommittee, to be held in 2016. 

22. The view was expressed that, owing to the growing number of actors in outer 
space and the diversification of outer space activities, there were a number of  
cross-cutting issues that the Committee should address, as it was the appropriate 
forum for resolving issues pertaining to space law, ensuring the safety and security 
of outer space, and making certain that the potential benefits of space science and 
technology were distributed equitably. 

23. The view was expressed that the Committee was the main platform for 
undertaking the development of an effective set of tools that would ensure the safe 
and responsible conduct of outer space activities, and for undertaking an assessment 
of the practical use of the recommendations contained in the report of the Group of 
Governmental Experts. Many of those recommendations could be converted into 
regulatory measures and could be implemented as future guidelines for the conduct 
of outer space activities. 

24. The view was expressed that strengthening the rule of law in outer space, 
promoting international cooperation in outer space, capacity-building and the  
long-term sustainability of outer space activities represented the core of the 
Committee’s work. The view was expressed that the Committee should improve the 
efficiency and effectiveness of its work by aligning itself with new developments in 
outer space activities so as to make progress in the following areas: strengthening 
the rule of law in outer space by focusing on promoting the practical application of 
existing outer space treaties; improving capacity-building by encouraging the full 
utilization of the initiatives of the Office for Outer Space Affairs, such as the Basic 
Space Science Initiative, the Human Space Technology Initiative and the seminars 
on space law undertaken by the Office; enabling technology transfers and 
eliminating technology embargos; and extending the support of the Office to the 
regional centres for space science and technology education, affiliated to the United 
Nations, to deepen international cooperation with a clear focus on the needs of 
developing countries and the promotion of action-oriented, project-based, equal and 
mutually beneficial cooperation so as to enable the further development of outer 
space activities. 

25. The view was expressed that the Committee should continue to promote 
regional and interregional cooperation and strengthen its engagement with space-
related regional mechanisms and initiatives, and that it should also examine new 
forms of cooperation to advance space utilization, with a special focus on 
collaboration between spacefaring and emerging spacefaring nations to bridge the 
development gap and work jointly towards the implementation of the post-2015 
development agenda. 

26. The view was expressed that the Committee should continue to work on 
elaborating and implementing future procedures to allow for greater efficiency and 
transparency in its work.  
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 J. Other matters  
 
 

27. The Committee considered the agenda item entitled “Other matters”, in 
accordance with General Assembly resolution 69/85. 

28. The representatives of Algeria, Argentina, Australia, Austria, Brazil, Bulgaria, 
Canada, Chile, China, Colombia, Costa Rica, Cuba, the Czech Republic, Ecuador, 
Egypt, France, Germany, Hungary, Indonesia, Iran (Islamic Republic of), Italy, 
Japan, Kenya, Lebanon, Luxembourg, Mexico, the Netherlands, Peru, Poland, 
Portugal, Romania, the Russian Federation, Saudi Arabia, Slovakia, the Sudan, 
Switzerland, the Syrian Arab Republic, Tunisia, Turkey, the United Kingdom and 
the United States made statements under the item. Statements were also made under 
the item by the representative of Egypt on behalf of the League of Arab States, and 
by the representative of Luxembourg on behalf of the European Union. During the 
general exchange of views, statements relating to the item were also made by 
representatives of other member States.  

29. The Committee heard a presentation entitled “Space education for young 
people”, by the representative of France.  
 

 1. Fiftieth anniversary of the United Nations Conference on the Exploration and 
Peaceful Uses of Outer Space 
 

30. The Committee had before it a note by the Secretariat entitled “Fiftieth 
anniversary of the United Nations Conference on the Exploration and Peaceful Uses 
of Outer Space: theme of the sessions of the Committee on the Peaceful Uses of 
Outer Space, its Scientific and Technical Subcommittee and its Legal Subcommittee 
in 2018” (A/AC.105/L.297). 

31. The Committee welcomed the proposals contained in the note and endorsed 
the plan of work contained in it, agreeing that the Secretariat should begin the 
preparatory work in the lead-up to the fiftieth anniversary of the United Nations 
Conference on the Exploration and Peaceful Uses of Outer Space in 2018 
(“UNISPACE+50”), in close consultation with the group of members of the bureaux 
of the Committee and its subsidiary bodies (the “Group of 15”), which would serve 
as the steering committee for the “UNISPACE+50” process. The Committee also 
encouraged the Secretariat to work with the Committee on Space Research, the 
International Aeronautical Federation and the International Academy of Astronautics 
in preparing the background documents for “UNISPACE+50”.  

32. The Committee requested the Secretariat to report to the Committee and its 
Subcommittees, at their respective sessions in 2016, on the progress made in the 
preparatory work. 
 

 2. Composition of the bureaux of the Committee and its subsidiary bodies for the 
period 2016-2017  
 

33. The Committee noted the nominations by the Asia-Pacific States, the Eastern 
European States, the Latin American and Caribbean States and the Western 
European and other States of their candidates for the offices of Chair of the 
Scientific and Technical Subcommittee, First Vice-Chair of the Committee, Chair of 
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the Legal Subcommittee and Chair of the Committee, respectively, for the  
period 2016-2017, as per General Assembly resolution 69/85, para. 29. 

34. The Committee also noted that the African States had decided that the Sudan 
would nominate its representative for the office of Second Vice-Chair/Rapporteur of 
the Committee for the period 2016-2017. In that regard, the Committee asked the 
Sudan to nominate its representative for that office before the seventieth session of 
the General Assembly. 
 

 3. Membership of the Committee  
 

35. The Committee had before it the applications for membership in the 
Committee from the following six States Members of the United Nations:  
El Salvador (A/AC.105/2015/CRP.4), Israel (A/AC.105/2015/CRP.8), Oman 
(A/AC.105/2015/CRP.7), Qatar (A/AC.105/2015/CRP.3), Sri Lanka 
(A/AC.105/2015/CRP.5) and United Arab Emirates (A/AC.105/2015/CRP.6). 

36. Some delegations expressed the view that the applications for membership 
should be considered on their merits and on a case-by-case basis. The applications 
should not be considered as a package with all six applications together because 
membership in an intergovernmental body, as a matter of principle, required the 
consideration of each applicant State.  

37. Some delegations expressed the view that all six applications should be 
considered as a package and that no individual action should be taken on a case-by-
case basis. Such consideration was important on the basis of universality and 
inclusiveness and in view of the consensus tradition of the Committee. 

38. Some delegations expressed the view that the application by Israel should not 
be accepted owing to broader politically sensitive issues relating to fundamental 
principles beyond the scope of the Committee with respect to maintaining 
international peace and security. Those delegations also expressed the view that 
Israel was acting in contravention of those fundamental principles and that, with an 
advanced military capacity, it could use membership in the Committee for military 
purposes, which was against the objectives of the Committee on the Peaceful Uses 
of Outer Space.  

39. Some delegations expressed the view that all six States, including Israel, 
which had an active programme for civil space activities, should be recommended 
for membership in the Committee, and that that would strengthen the Committee. 
Those delegations also expressed the view that the consideration of membership 
should not be politicized beyond the activities of the Committee and that the 
Committee would benefit from the commitment and involvement of those countries 
in meeting its objective to foster international cooperation in the peaceful uses of 
outer space. 

40. Some delegations expressed the view that membership in the Committee 
should be connected to the accession to the United Nations treaties on outer space 
and that applicant States should be asked to accede to one or more of those treaties, 
at least the Treaty on Principles Governing the Activities of States in the 
Exploration and Use of Outer Space, including the Moon and Other Celestial 
Bodies, if they had not already done so. 
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41. The view was expressed that the applications submitted by El Salvador, Oman, 
Qatar, Sri Lanka and the United Arab Emirates should be recommended for 
membership as a package in view of the fact that no objections had been raised 
regarding those applications, while the application of Israel, regarding which 
objections had been raised, should be transmitted to the General Assembly for 
action without any comment by the Committee. 

42. The Committee noted that the history of membership in the Committee had 
been a complex matter, including the past practice of sharing seats among member 
States on a rotating basis, past agreement on limited increase in membership growth 
and consideration of equitable geographical distribution among the five regional 
groups, and that for many years the Committee had transmitted membership 
applications directly to the General Assembly for action without any consideration 
or recommendation made by the Committee. The Committee also noted, in that 
regard, that its practice regarding membership had evolved over the years and that, 
since the abolition of the principle of equitable geographical distribution and 
limitation of membership growth in 2004, there had been no firm procedures 
established for its consideration of membership. The Committee agreed that, in view 
of the divergent views expressed at its present session regarding the method to be 
used for consideration of the applications for membership, the only way forward 
was for the Committee not to make any recommendation or comment on any of the 
present applications. In that regard, the Committee noted that the applications 
should be submitted to the Fourth Committee of the General Assembly for its action 
on the basis of a separate draft General Assembly decision to be tabled by an 
applicant State or group of applicant States, and that the application should not be 
addressed in the draft resolution on international cooperation in the peaceful uses of 
outer space.  
 

 4. Organizational matters  
 

43. The Committee endorsed the agreement of the Legal Subcommittee at its  
fifty-fourth session, in 2015 (A/AC.105/1090, para. 235), to discontinue the use of 
unedited transcripts and to use digital recordings on a permanent basis, on the 
understanding that the digital recording application should be further enhanced. 

44. In accordance with the decision made by the Committee in 2011 (A/66/20, 
para. 297), and on the basis of the proposal made by the Secretariat to discontinue 
the use of unedited transcripts (A/AC.105/C.2/L.282), the Committee agreed to use 
digital recordings on a permanent basis, and agreed that the digital recording 
application should be further enhanced. 

45. The Committee endorsed the decision of the Scientific and Technical 
Subcommittee, at its fifty-second session, in 2015 (A/AC.105/1088, para. 275), to 
revise the criteria established by the Committee at its fifty-fourth session, in 2011 
(A/66/20, para. 298), and the agreement by the Subcommittee made at its  
fiftieth session, in 2013 (A/AC.105/1038, para. 242), in order to secure the time 
needed for the work of the working groups and to give the Secretariat a clear 
mandate to implement those criteria. In that regard, the Committee endorsed the 
recommendation of the Subcommittee that the same criteria should apply, as 
appropriate, to the organization of work of the Committee, which, like the 
Subcommittee, regularly had a high number of scientific and technical 
presentations.  
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46. The Committee requested the Secretariat to demonstrate to the Scientific and 
Technical Subcommittee, at its fifty-third session, in 2016, any available technical 
means of assisting delegations in keeping track of the length of statements and 
presentations. 

47. The Committee requested the Secretariat to make available for the sessions of 
the Committee and its Subcommittees, in 2016, a compendium containing the rules, 
procedures and practices, including the processing of documentation, of the 
Committee and its subsidiary bodies. 
 

 5. Draft provisional agenda for the fifty-ninth session of the Committee  
 

48. The Committee recommended that the following items should be considered at 
its fifty-ninth session, in 2016:  

 1. Election of officers. 

 2. General exchange of views. 

 3. Ways and means of maintaining outer space for peaceful purposes.  

 4. Report of the Scientific and Technical Subcommittee on its fifty-third 
session.  

 5. Report of the Legal Subcommittee on its fifty-fifth session.  

 6. Space and sustainable development. 

 7. Spin-off benefits of space technology: review of current status.  

 8. Space and water. 

 9. Space and climate change. 

 10. Use of space technology in the United Nations system.  

 11. Future role of the Committee. 

 12. Other matters. 
 
 

 K. Schedule of work of the Committee and its subsidiary bodies 
 
 

49. The Committee agreed on the following tentative timetable for its session and 
those of its Subcommittees in 2016: 

 Date Location 

Scientific and Technical Subcommittee 15 to 26 February 2016 Vienna 
Legal Subcommittee 4 to 15 April 2016 Vienna 
Committee on the Peaceful Uses of Outer Space 8 to 17 June 2016 Vienna 

 


